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Nicky has freckles—they cover his face, his ears, and the whole back of his neck. Sitting behind him in class,
Andrew once counted eighty-six of them, and that was just a start! If Andrew had freckles like Nicky, his
mother would never know if his neck was dirty.

One day after school, Andrew works up enough courage to ask Nicky where he got his freckles. When
know-it-all Sharon overhears, she offers Andrew her secret freckle juice recipe—if he pays. Andrew is
desperate and feels it's worth it. At home he carefully mixes the strange combination of ingredients. Then the
unexpected happens...

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Barragan:

Here thing why that Freckle Juice are different and reputable to be yours. First of all reading a book is good
nonetheless it depends in the content of it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Freckle Juice
giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no book that
similar with Freckle Juice. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your own eyes about the
thing in which happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can actually bring
everywhere like in park, café, or even in your means home by train. Should you be having difficulties in
bringing the published book maybe the form of Freckle Juice in e-book can be your alternative.

Louise Hawkins:

Reading a book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire all their reader with their story or
perhaps their experience. Not only the story that share in the ebooks. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids,
there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their expertise
in writing, they also doing some study before they write on their book. One of them is this Freckle Juice.

Emma Berkey:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book had been rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some
people likes reading, not only science book but novel and Freckle Juice as well as others sources were given
know-how for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel desire to read more and more.
Science guide was created for teacher or students especially. Those books are helping them to include their
knowledge. In additional case, beside science e-book, any other book likes Freckle Juice to make your spare
time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Mary Brunner:

Some people said that they feel fed up when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt that when they get
a half portions of the book. You can choose the particular book Freckle Juice to make your own reading is
interesting. Your current skill of reading proficiency is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose
easy book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the idea about book and studying especially. It is to be
1st opinion for you to like to available a book and study it. Beside that the book Freckle Juice can to be your
brand-new friend when you're sense alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of these time.
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